


























































































































Line 
#

CALIBER
Estimated 

Annual 
Usage

Unit of 
Measure 

(CS)

Unit Price         ( 
Per Case)

Extended 
Price per case

Specify Brand Specify Model #
Specify NUMBER of 
delivery days after 

receipt of order (ARO)

1 9 mm Duty 980 CS -$                     

2 9 mm Training
135 GRAIN, Luger FMJ Training
Hornady 90238  or EQUIVALENT
50 RD/BX  10BX/CASE

100 CS -$                     

3 9 mm Training
115 Grain, Luger TAP Training
Hornady 90249  or EQUIVALENT
50 RD/BX; 10 BX/CASE

4500 CS -$                     

4 9 mm Training 300 CS -$                     

Line 
#

CALIBER
Estimated 

Annual 
Usage

Unit of 
Measure 

(CS)

Unit Price         ( 
Per Case)

Extended 
Price per case

Specify Brand Specify Model #
Specify NUMBER of 
delivery days after 

receipt of order (ARO)

5 .223 Caliber Training 200 CS

-$                     

6 .223 Caliber Training 2600 CS

-$                     

7 .223 Caliber Training 3320 CS

-$                     

8 .223 Caliber Duty 1220 CS

-$                     

9 .223 Caliber Duty 200 CS

-$                     

10 6.5MM 

147 Grain, Creedmoor ELD-Match TAP 
Hornady #81505 ;  or EQUIVALENT
MUST BE FROM THE SAME LOT
20 RD/BX, 200 RD/CS

400 CS

-$                     

11 308 Caliber Duty

168 Grain, WIN ELD Match TAP 
Precision, 
Hornady #80725 or EQUIVALENT
20 RD/BX

200 CS

-$                     

12 5.56 Caliber Duty 1750 CS

-$                     

13 5.56 Caliber Training
55 Grain, NATO FMJ TAP, Hornady       
#81278 or EQUIVALENT
50 RD/BX, 500 RD/CS

200 CS

-$                     

14 5.56 Caliber Duty 600 CS

-$                     

Line 
#

CALIBER
Estimated 

Annual 
Usage

Unit of 
Measure 

(CS)

Unit Price         ( 
Per Case)

Extended 
Price per case

Specify Brand Specify Model #
Specify NUMBER of 
delivery days after 

receipt of order (ARO)

15 00 BUCK Duty
12 Gauge 9 Pellet Duty, Federal LE127-00 
or EQUIVALENT
250 RD/CS 100 CS

-$                     

16 Bird Shot
100 CS -$                     

17

53 Grain, NATO GMX TAP Patrol, 
Hornady #81275 or EQUIVALENT
20 RD/BX, 200 RD/CS

STATE OF NEBRASKA

State Catalog and/or Price List Name:

________________________________

55 Grain, FMJ Training REM Winchester 
#USA223R1  
NO ALTERNATE ACCEPTED
20 OR 50 RD/BX; 1000 RD/CASE 

55 Grain, FMJ Training, REM       Hornady 
#80275 or EQUIVALENT
20 OR 50 RD/BX; 1000 RD/CASE

53 Grain, FMJ GMX TAP Patrol Duty, 
REM Hornady #80295
NO ALTERNATE ACCEPTED
20 RD/BX, 200 RD/CASE

SHOTGUN AMMUNTION

75 Grain, NATO BTHP Match, Frontier 
#FR320 or EQUIVALENT
20 RD/BX, 500 RD/CS

The Catalog or Current Manufacturer's Price List(s) shall accompany each bid submitted.

Catalog/Non-Core Items are defined as those additional items available from the Vendor but not listed as Core Items.

Items identified as Catalog/Non-Core items shall be represented by a Catalog or Current Manufacturer's Price List (s) containing items not called out as Core items on this document.

ATTACHMENT A

 BID SHEET for AMMUNITION
6707 OF

Company Bidding:___________________________________________________

PISTOL AMMUNTION

DESCRIPTION

OTHER AMMUNITION
NON-CORE

STATE % OF DISCOUNT OFF CATALOG/PRICE LIST
____________________ %

135 Grain Luger+P Critical Duty Hornady 
#90225  or EQUIVALENT
50RD/BX 10 BX/CASE

115 Grain, Luger FMJ Training
FIOCCHI #CH9AP   or EQUIVALENT 
50RD/BX 10 BX/CASE

DESCRIPTION

55 Grain, Pointed Soft Point, New 
Casings; Winchester RA223R-PSP, 
Federal T223A, 
NO ALTERNATE ACCEPTED
20 RD/BX, 200 RD/CASE

7.5-8 PELLET, Winchester TRG127, 
Federal TGL 128 or EQUIVALENT
250 RD/CS

RIFLE AMMUNTION

DESCRIPTION

55 Grain, REM Spire Point Training 
Hornady Frontier #FR120  or 
EQUIVALENT
20 OR 50 RD/BX; 1000 RD/CASE 

NON-CORE AMMUNTION

Kiesler Police Supply Inc.

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No BidNo Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$237.54 Federal AE9DP 
1000 rds per case 9-24 months35,631.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No BidNo Bid

$223.63 1,484,903.20 Federal AE223
500 round case 20-24 months

No Bid No Bid No BidNo Bid No Bid

$279.72 22,377.60 Federal T223A
500 round case 20-24 months

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$221.49 44,298.00 Federal
GM308M
200 rds per case

9-24 months

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$172.05 17,205.00 Federal LE12700
250 rd case 9-24 months

$80.46 8,046.00 Federal TGL12/8 
250 rd case 9-24 months

15% Off MSRP

*Must order by the case on all ammunition. Minimum order for drop ship is
3 cases total. Lead time may vary depending on market and demand.*

Kiesler Catalog
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